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- I recognise the main purpose 
and intended audience of a 
text. 

-I identify the main purpose 
and intended audience of a 
text. 

-I describe the purpose and 
intended audience of a text.  

-I explain the purpose and 
intended audience of a text. 

-I explain in detail the purpose 
and intended audience of a 
text. 
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 - I recognise the main ideas in a 

text. 
-I identify the main and minor 
ideas in a text. 
 

-I describe the main and minor 
ideas of a text. 
-I identify links between the 
main and minor ideas. 
 

-I explain the connections 
between the main and minor 
ideas of a text.  

-I explain in detail the 
connections between the main 
and minor ideas of a text.  
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- I support one or two of my 
points with evidence from the 
text. 

-I support some of my points 
with evidence from the text.  

-I support most of my points 
with evidence from the text. 

-I support all my points with 
evidence from the text. 

-I support all my points with a 
range of evidence from the 
text.  
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- I recognise how a text is 
structured. 

-I identify how a text is 
structured. 

-I describe how a text is 
structured.  

- I explain how the structure of 
a text affects meaning and 
purpose. 

-I explain in detail how the 
structure of a text affects 
meaning and purpose.  
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- I recognise a range of 
techniques in a text. 

-I identify a range of techniques 
in a text. 

-I describe the effects 
techniques in a text. 

-I explain the effects 
techniques in a text. 

-I explain in detail the effects of 
a range techniques in a text. 
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- I recognise that texts are 
written in different times and 
places. 

- I identify when a text is 
written.  

- I describe the effects of 
context on meaning.  

- I explain the effects of 
context on meaning and the 
writer’s purpose. 

- I explain in detail the effects 
of context on meaning and the 
writer’s purpose.  
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 - My essay is organised into 

sections. 
-I express ideas with some 
clarity. 

- My essay has an introduction, 
paragraphs and a conclusion. 
-I express most of my ideas 
clearly. 

-My essay has an introduction, 
linked paragraphs and a 
conclusion. 
-I express ideas clearly. 

- My essay develops an 
argument. 
-I express ideas with 
confidence. 
 

- My essay develops a coherent 
argument. 
-I express ideas with 
sophistication and confidence.  

 


